RFQ No. 17/74 DELL COMPUTERS
3/16/17 @3:00PM

Aprisa Technology CDW-G Staples
LLC

#1 DELL LATITUDE 3189 11" 2-in-1 LAPTOP with 8GB

Specifications Met No Yes Yes

BASE PRICE $ 558.00 | see below $ 556.51

Option 1 - 3 Year Basic Warranty $246.00 + Base Price | $ 484.00 | $ 556.51

Option 2 - 3 Year NBD Warranty $325.00 + Base Price | $ 534.00 | $ 602.56

Option 3 - 3 Year NBD Warranty with Accidental Damage Protection $432.00 + Base Price | $ 568.00 | $ 663.19

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty $338.00 + Base Price | $ 504.00 | $ 614.80

Option 5 - 4 Year NBD Warranty $438.00 + Base Price | $ 564.00 | $ 666.68

Option 6 - 4 Year NBD Warranty with Accidental Damage Protection $566.00 + Base Price | $ 604.00 | $ 739.55
#2 DELL LATITUDE 5289 4GB 12" 2-in-1 LAPTOP with 4GB (8GB is Required)

Specifications Met Yes Yes No

BASE PRICE $ 938.00 | see below $ 1,116.38

Option 1 - 3 Year Basic Warranty $245.00+Base Price | $ 82200 | $ 1,116.38

Option 2 - 3 Year NBD Warranty $348.00 + Base Price | $ 868.00 [ $ 1,175.09

Option 3 - 3 Year NBD Warranty with Accidental Damage Protection| $465.00 + Base Price | $ 923.00 [ $ 1,242.68

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty $320.00 + Base Price | $ 854.00 | $ 1,247.24

Option 5 - 4 Year NBD Warranty $494.00 + Base Price | $ 923.00 [ $ 1,312.46

Option 6 - 4 Year NBD Warranty with Accidental Damage Protection| $628.00 + Base Price | $ 996.00 [ $ 1,398.44
#3 |DELL LATITUDE 3160 11.6" Touch Laptop with 8GB

Specifications Met No No Bid No

BASE PRICE see below No Bid $  461.38

Option 1 - 3 Year Basic Warranty $ 488.00 | No Bid $ 461.38

Option 2 - 3 Year NBD Warranty $204.00 + Base Price | No Bid $ 510.60

Option 3 - 3 Year NBD Warranty with Accidental Damage Protection $308.00 + Base Price | No Bid $ 575.41

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty $60.00 + Base Price | No Bid $ 523.69

Option 5 - 4 Year NBD Warranty $312.00 + Base Price | No Bid $ 579.15

Option 6 - 4 Year NBD Warranty with Accidental Damage Protection $442.00 + Base Price | No Bid $ 657.04
#4 DELL LATITUDE 3350 13.3" Touch Laptop with 8GB

Specifications Met No No Bid No

BASE PRICE $ 858.00 | No Bid $ 764.45

Option 1 - 3 Year Basic Warranty $ 858.00 | No Bid $ 764.45

Option 2 - 3 Year NBD Warranty $204.00 + Base Price | No Bid $ 809.71

Option 3 - 3 Year NBD Warranty with Accidental Damage Protection $308.00 + Base Price | No Bid $ 869.29

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty $60.00 + Base Price | No Bid $ 821.74

Option 5 - 4 Year NBD Warranty $312.00 + Base Price | No Bid $ 872.72

Option 6 - 4 Year NBD Warranty with Accidental Damage Protection $442.00 + Base Price | No Bid $ 944.33
#5 DELL LATITUDE 5289 12" 2-in-1 LAPTOP with 8GB

Specifications Met Yes Yes Yes

BASE PRICE $ 1,238.00 | see below $ 1,169.75

Option 1 - 3 Year Basic Warranty $245.00 + Base Price | $ 864.00 [ $ 1,169.75

Option 2 - 3 Year NBD Warranty $348.00 + Base Price | $ 909.00 [ $ 1,288.74

Option 3 - 3 Year NBD Warranty with Accidental Damage Protection| $465.00 + Base Price | $ 956.00 [ $ 1,356.34

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty $320.00 + Base Price | $ 896.00 [ $ 1,300.60

Option 5 - 4 Year NBD Warranty $494.00 + Base Price | $ 964.00 [ $ 1,365.83

Option 6 - 4 Year NBD Warranty with Accidental Damage Protection| $628.00 + Base Price | $ 1,038.00 | $ 1,451.81
#6 USB Docking Station - Dell D3100 (Dell Part #452-BBPG) or Equal

BASE PRICE | $ 12800 |$ 105.00|$ 118.73

AWARD TO CDW-G




